
Penthouse 508 - Saint Peter's Bay

St. Peter's Bay Resort, Road View, Little Battaleys, Barbados
US$ 1,370

Description

One Caribbean Estates proudly presents for vacation rental 508 Penthouse, Saint Peterâ€™s Bay. Inspired by traditional
Bajan architecture, this luxurious penthouse at Saint Peterâ€™s Bay offers the ultimate in open living spaces, privacy, and
breathtaking views. Generous terraces on the main floor and a rooftop terrace with a hot tub provide the perfect setting for
enjoying the idyllic weather and scenery. This penthouse features three beautiful en-suite bedrooms accented with marble
tiles, white-washed cedar joinery, and coral mouldings. Enjoy beachfront living with sweeping ocean views. These
spectacular penthouses feature three large en-suite bedrooms, a fully equipped kitchen and laundry area, spacious living
areas, and a large ocean-view terrace with outdoor dining. The private roof sun terrace with a spa pool is an added luxury,
making this villa ideal for comfortably accommodating six adults. The apartment offers elevator access to the main entrance
and a unique â€˜bikini elevatorâ€™ straight down to the pool and beach. With luxurious amenities and facilities, a stay at
this Barbados vacation rental promises an unforgettable experience. Room amenities include a full kitchen, bathtub, safe,
telephone, slippers, air conditioning, balcony, bathroom amenities, cable television, and bathrobe. Staff List Housekeeping
Rates Please enquire. In the Area Beaches: Steps away from the beach Local attractions: Nearby shops, restaurants, and
cultural sites What Our Guests Say About Saint Peterâ€™s Bay Penthouse Guests rave about the stunning ocean
views, spacious living areas, and the unique rooftop terrace with a hot tub. The blend of traditional Bajan architecture with
modern luxury amenities makes this penthouse a perfect choice for a Caribbean beachfront home for rent. Thank you for
exploring this luxury Barbados property listed on One Caribbean Estates. One Caribbean Estates is the leading Barbados
real estate firm serving the niche luxury property market along the islandâ€™s famed West Coast and in other key areas
across this beautiful Caribbean island. Browsing our portfolio of luxury Barbados properties, you will find beachfront villas,
modern condominiums, and stunning homes within the Sandy Lane Estate, Port St. Charles Marina, Canouan Estate Resort
& Villas, Sugar Hill Tennis Resort, Royal Westmoreland Golf Community, and more.



Details

Bedrooms: 3

Bathrooms: 3

Property Type: Penthouse

Property Status: Vacation

Features

 Air Conditioning  Jacuzzi  Beachfront

 Resort Pool  Resort Facilities  24hr Security

 Gated Community  Close to Restaurants  Roof Terrace

 Family Friendly  Assigned Parking  Water Sports

 Wifi & Cable  Fully Enclosed  Landscaped Gardens

 Communal Pool  Ocean Views  Communal facilities

 Elegant furnishings  Penthouse  Covered Terrace

Gallery
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